



EMERALD COAST UTILITIES AUTHORITY
BID 2014-02
SUBMERSIBLE PUMPS
BID OPENING: JANUARY 7, 2014, 2:00 pm
CIP PROJECT RS032
Baskerville-Donovan Inc. - Scott Jernigan

VENDORS	NUMBER OF PUMPS	PROPOSAL SIGNED YES/NO	ADDENDUM #1 ACKNOWLEDGED	BASE BID MFG/MDL NUMBER	BASE BID UNIT COST	BASE BID EXTENDED COST	COST ADDER EXPEDITED DELIVERY	BASE BID SPARE PARTS TOTAL COST	ALT MFG/MDL NUMBER	ALT UNIT COST	ALT EXTENDED COST	COST ADDER EXPEDITED DELIVERY	ALT SPARE PARTS TOTAL COST	EXCEPTIONS YES/NO
PUMP & PROCESS EQUIPMENT PENSACOLA FL	4	YES	YES	KSB KRT K300-400 1006XNG	\$49,750.00	\$199,000.00	NOT AVAILABLE	\$10,574.00	KSB KRT K300-400 1006XNG2-K	\$53,000.00	\$212,000.00	NOT AVAILABLE	\$14,369.00	NO
GILBERT MARY ESTHER FL	4	YES	YES	GUNDFOS 52.55.A120.1470.6.70M	\$61,500.00	\$246,000.00	\$-00	\$7,500.00	GRUNDFOS 52.55.A120.1470.6.70M.Q	\$64,250.00	\$257,000.00	\$-00	\$10,500.00	YES
WILO LLC THOMASVILLE GA	4	YES	YES	WILO FA 35.54T	\$85,808.00	\$343,232.00	NA	\$5,040.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	YES