
LIFT STATION #12 DIESEL COST NATURAL GAS COST DIESEL COST NATURAL GAS COST

200KW/205KW $42,546.00 $96,023.00 $62,445.00 NO BID

ELLYSON CNG

250KW/250KW

GODWIN LN CNG

350KW/450KW

WARRINGTON

550KW/550KW

TOTAL BID $270,427.00 $768,025.00 $316,343.00 $0.00

SIGNED PROPOSAL Y/N

EXCEPTIONS Y/N

ATS LS #12

MOBILE AL THOEDORE, AL

CUMMINS MID-WOUTH LLC

YES YES

TAYLOR POWER SYSTEMS

EMERALD COAST UTILITIES AUTHORITY

BID NUMBER:  2013-17

BID OPENING DATE: SEPTEMBER 19, 2013 2:00 P.M.

GENERATOR

$61,211.00 $96,023.00 $70,943.00 NO BID

PERMANENT DIESEL EMERGENCY/STANDBY POWER SYSTEM

$73,243.00 $232,955.00 $78,146.00 NO BID

$80,358.00 $329,955.00 $92,260.00 NO BID

$13,069.00 $13,069.00 $12,549.00 NO BID

YES YES


