EMERALD COAST UTILITIES AUTHORITY

BID NUMBER: 2011-01
TAPPING SADDLES FOR CA/CI, PVC, FORD YOKE BOX GRADE ADJUSTERS,

REPAIR CLAMPS, WATER COUPLINGS, SWIVEL BENDS, GASKETS
CONTRACT DURATION: ONE YEAR CONTRACT (WITH TWO ONE-YEAR OPTIONAL EXTENSIONS

UPON MUTUAL AGREEMENT OF BOTH PARTIES, WITH NO INCREASE IN PRICE).
Bid Opening January 4, 2011 - 2:00 P.M.

HD SUPPLY

FERGUSON WATERWORKS| WATERWORKS LTD. EMPIRE PIPE & SUPPLY | CONSOLDATED PIPE VELLANO BROS
Page 2 QUANTITY PENSACOLA, FL PENSACOLA, FL BIRMINGHAM, AL MILTON, FL ROBERTSDALE, AL
ITEM B: TAPPING SADDLES F/SDR26 CLASS 2000 PVC EACH
MANUFACTURER & MODEL FORD S70 FORD S70 FORD S70 & S90 NO BID NO BID
2" X 1" 30 $13.28 $398.40 $12.43| $372.90 $12.75| $382.50
3" X 1" 45 $17.52 $788.40 $16.40( $738.00 $16.85| $758.25
4" X 1" 40 $20.26 $824.80 $19.30] $772.00 $19.85[ $794.00
4" X 11/2" 10 $44.40 $444.00 $41.59( $415.90 $42.68| $426.80
4 X2" 15 $44.40 $666.00 $41.59] $623.85 $42.68| $640.20
6" X 1" 40 $30.76] $1,230.40 $28.80| $1,152.00 $29.55( $1,182.00
6" X 11/2" 6 $58.04 $348.24 $54.35| $326.10 $55.80[ $334.80
6" X 2" 20 $58.04 $1,160.80 $54.27| $1,085.40 $55.80| $1,116.00
8" X 1" 5 $42.27 $211.35 $39.58| $197.90 $40.65[ $203.25
8" X11/2" 1 $59.84 $59.84 $56.04 $56.04 $57.50 $57.50
8" X 2" 2 $59.84 $119.68 $56.04| $112.08 $57.50( $115.00
10" X 1" 1 $81.56 $81.56 $76.35 $76.35 $78.40 $78.40
10" X 2" 2 $116.35 $232.70 $108.88[ $217.76 $111.85[ $223.70
12" X 1" 8 $125.35[ $1,002.80 $101.60[ $812.80 $120.50( $964.00
12" X 2" 5 $125.35 $626.75 $117.38[ $586.90 $120.50( $602.50
TOTAL ITEM B: $8,195.72 $7,545.98 $7,878.90
EXCEPTIONS: YES/NO NO NO NO
ITEM C: FORD YOKE BOX GRADE ADJUST 500 $19.81| $9,905.10 $19.30| $9,650.00|NO BID | NO BID | NO BID |

MANUFACTURER & MODEL

FORD 9501

FORD 9501

EXCEPTIONS: YES/NO

NO

NO




