
Page 4 QUANTITY

EACH UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED

50 $7.75 $387.50 $7.22 $361.00 $7.86 $393.00 $7.76 $388.00

300 $8.60 $2,580.00 $8.02 $2,406.00 $8.72 $2,616.00 $8.61 $2,583.00

200 $9.80 $1,960.00 $8.02 $1,828.00 $9.92 $1,984.00 $9.80 $1,960.00

100 $12.25 $1,225.00 $11.41 $1,141.00 $12.39 $1,239.00 $12.24 $1,224.00

200 $13.90 $2,780.00 $13.00 $2,600.00 $14.10 $2,820.00 $13.93 $2,786.00

48 $15.15 $727.20 $16.64 $798.72 $15.30 $734.40 $15.14 $726.72

300 $17.15 $5,325.00 $16.97 $5,091.00 $18.40 $5,520.00 $18.19 $5,457.00

50 $43.00 $2,150.00 $40.73 $2,036.50 $44.20 $2,210.00 $43.64 $2,182.00

40 $47.00 $1,880.00 $44.57 $1,782.80 $48.30 $1,932.00 $47.75 $1,910.00

19,014.70 $18,045.02 $19,448.40 $19,216.72

600 $14.08 $8,448.00 $13.17 $7,902.00 $13.25 $7,950.00

200 20.01 4,002.00 18.72 3,744.00 18.80 3,760.00

P/N:

400 $15.72 $6,288.00 $14.71 $5,884.00 $14.80 $5,920.00

200 $21.44 $4,288.00 $20.06 $4,012.00 $20.20 $4,040.00

$23,026.00 $21,542.00 21,670.00

200 $4.53 $906.00 $4.23 $846.00 $4.65 $930.00

$906.00 $846.00 $930.00

MUST BE ORDER IN CARTON QUANTITIES

Ford

NO BID

L04-44S

DRESSER 65 & 38

NO

Ford

NO BID

LA04-44S

LO4-33S

LA04-33S

CONSOLIDATE PIPE VELLANO BROS

ROBERTSDALE, AL

NO BID

NO BID

Ford

LA04-33S

NO

NG-FF4

LA04-33S

LA04-44S

LO4-33S

NO

L04-44S L04-44S

LO4-33S LO4-33S

LA04-33S

FordFord

LA04-44S

L04-44S

LA04-44S

NO BID

Ford

NO NO

NO

EXCEPTIONS:  YES/NO

P/N: NG-FF4

TOTAL ITEM G:

NG-FF4

ITEM G:  GASKETS

MANUFACTURER & MODEL

1"NUT & GASKET,F/CORPORATION STOP

NO

NG-FF4

Ford

NG-FF4

NO

NG-FF4

EXCEPTIONS:  YES/NO

MANUFACTURER & MODEL

1" 90 °

P/N:

L04-33S

3" Style 38

Ford

LA04-44-S

L04-44S

TOTAL ITEM F:

3/4" 90 °

P/N:

LA04-33S

1" 45˚

P/N:

EMERALD COAST UTILITIES AUTHORITY

BID NUMBER:  20011--01

TAPPING SADDLES F/CA-CI-PVC, FORD YOKE BOX GRADE ADJUSTERS. 

REPAIR CLAMPS, WATER COUPLINGS, SWIVEL BENDS, GASKETS

3/4" 45 °

MANUFACTURER & MODEL

HD SUPPLY

NO

EMPIRE PIPE & SUPPLY

BIRMINGHAM. ALPENSACOLA, FL

DRESSER 65 & 38

PENSACOLA, FL

NO

Ford Ford

CONTRACT DURATION:  ONE YEAR CONTRACT (WITH TWO ONE-YEAR OPTIONAL EXTENSIONS

UPON MUTUAL AGREEMENT OF BOTH PARTIES, WITH NO INCREASE IN PRICE).

Bid Opening January 4, 2011 - 2:00 P.M.

DRESSER 65 & 38 DRESSER 65 & 38

ITEM E:  WATER COUPLINGS

WATERWORKS WATERWORKS LTD.

FERGUSON 

1/2" Style 65 long

3/4" Style 65 long

EXCEPTIONS:  YES/NO

1" Style 65 long

1 1/2" Style 65 long

1 1/2" Style 65 short

2" Style 65 long

TOTAL ITEM E:

1 1/4" Style 65 long

4" Style 38

ITEM F:  SWIVEL BENDS


